
 

 

Shentou Power Generation Company and Taiyuan North Central 
High-tech Industrial Development Zone Sign Strategic Cooperation 

Agreement 

On July 1, 2021, the delegation of Shentou Power Generation Company met with Mr. Du 
Xiaoling, Director of Management Committee of Taiyuan North Central High-tech Industrial 
Development Zone. The parties reached a consensus on in-depth technical exchanges and 
cooperation in the fields of integrated energy services, multi-energy complementarity, electric 
energy storage, hydrogen energy and smart microgrid, and signed a framework agreement on 
strategic cooperation. 

Mr. Zhang Jin, GM of Shentou Power Generation Company, briefly introduced the 
implementation of China's "3060" carbon targets and CPID's annual development tasks and 
expressed his gratitude for the support and assistance given by the Management Committee of 
Taiyuan North Central High-tech Industrial Development Zone. He also expressed that 
Shentou Power Generation Company would take Taiyuan North Central High-tech Industrial 
Development Zone as a key development area, give full play to its industrial technology and 
capital advantages, focus on the user side, build an smart energy system with multi-energy 
complementation of "source, grid, load, storage, and charging", provide green power for the 
smart park, help the park achieve its carbon targets as soon as possible, create an intelligent 
manufacturing industry base, and boost the "civilized, rich, open and beautiful" construction 
of Taiyuan. 

Mr. Du Xiaoling welcomed Mr. Zhang Jin and his delegation, introduced the development of 
Taiyuan North Central High-tech Industrial Development Zone and the characteristics and 
advantages of "one zone and two parks", and expressed his recognition towards the 
development idea of Shentou Power Generation Company. Mr. Du said that Taiyuan North 
Central High-tech Industrial Development Zone would treat Shentou Power Generation 
Company as a long-term, stable and important strategic partner and give maximum support 
and assistance in industrial planning, supporting policies, resource allocation and 
coordination. 




